

THE HONORABLE DAVID G. ESTUDILLO

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
WESTERN DISTRICT OF WASHINGTON

AARON WILLIAMS, on behalf of himself and all
others similarly situated,

Plaintiff,

vs.

PILLPACK LLC,

Defendant.

Case No. 3:19-cv-05282-DGE

**DECLARATION OF ANTHONY PARONICH
IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S MOTION
FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES, COSTS, AND
SERVICE AWARD**

I, Anthony Paronich, hereby declare as follows:

1. I am over 18 years of age, I make this declaration based on my own personal knowledge, and I am competent to testify to the facts in this declaration.

A. Background and experience

2. I am an attorney duly admitted to practice in the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, I am over 18 years of age, and I am competent to testify and make this affidavit on personal knowledge. I have extensive experience in the prosecution of class actions on behalf of consumers, particularly claims under the TCPA.

3. I am a 2010 graduate of Suffolk Law School. In 2010, I was admitted to the Bar in Massachusetts. Since then, I have been admitted to practice before the Federal District Court for the District of Massachusetts, the Northern District of Illinois, the Eastern District of Michigan, the Western District of Wisconsin, the Southern District of Indiana, the First Circuit

1 Court of Appeals, the Seventh Circuit Court of Appeals, and the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals.
2 From time to time, I have appeared in other State and Federal District Courts *pro hac vice*. I am
3 in good standing in every court to which I am admitted to practice.

4 4. I was an associate at Broderick Law, P.C. in Boston, Massachusetts from 2010
5 through 2016.

6 5. I was a partner at Broderick & Paronich, P.C. in Boston, Massachusetts from 2016
7 through 2019.

8 6. In 2019, I started Paronich Law, P.C., focused on protecting consumers in class
9 action lawsuits.

10 7. I have been appointed class counsel in more than 50 TCPA cases, including the
11 following:

12 i. Desai and Charvat v. ADT Security Services, Inc., USDC, N.D. Ill., 11-CV-1925, a
13 TCPA class settlement of \$15,000,000 granted final approval on June 21, 2013.

14 ii. Jay Clogg Realty Group, Inc. v. Burger King Corporation, USDC, D. Md., 13-cv-
15 00662, a TCPA class settlement of \$8,500,000 granted final approval on April 15,
2015.

16 iii. Charvat v. AEP Energy, Inc., USDC, N.D. Ill., 1:14-cv-03121, a TCPA class
17 settlement of \$6,000,000 granted final approval on September 28, 2015.

18 iv. Bull v. US Coachways, Inc., USDC, N.D. Ill., 1:14-cv-05789, a TCPA class
19 settlement finally approved on November 11, 2016 with an agreement for
20 judgment in the amount of \$49,932,375 and an assignment of rights against
defendant's insurance carrier.

21 v. Smith v. State Farm Mut. Auto. Ins. Co., et. al., USDC, N.D. Ill., 1:13-cv-02018, a
22 TCPA class settlement of \$7,000,000.00 granted final approval on December 8,
2016.

23 vi. Mey v. Frontier Communications Corporation, USDC, D. Conn., 3:13-cv-1191-
24 MPS, a TCPA class settlement of \$11,000,000 granted final approval on June 2,
2017.

25 vii. Heidarpour v. Central Payment Co., USDC, M.D. Ga., 15-cv-139, a TCPA class
26 settlement of \$6,500,000 granted final approval on May 4, 2017.
27

- 1 viii. Abante Rooter and Plumbing, Inc. v. Birch Communications, Inc., USDC, N.D. Ga.,
2 1:15-CV-03562-AT, a TCPA class settlement of \$12,000,000 granted final
3 approval on December 14, 2017.
- 4 ix. Abante Rooter and Plumbing, Inc. v. Pivotal Payments, Inc., USDC, N.D. Ca., 3:16-
5 cv-05486-JCS, a TCPA class settlement of \$9,000,000 granted final approval on
6 October 15, 2018.
- 7 x. In re Monitronics International, Inc., USDC, N.D.W. Va., 1:13-md-02493-JPB-JES,
8 a TCPA class settlement of \$28,000,0000 granted final approval on June 12,
9 2018.
- 10 xi. Thomas Krakauer v. Dish Network, L.L.C., USDC, M.D.N.C., 1:14-CV-333 on
11 September 9, 2015. Following a contested class certification motion, this case
12 went to trial in January of 2017 returning a verdict of \$20,446,400. On May 22,
13 2017, this amount was trebled by the Court after finding that Dish Network’s
14 violations were “willful or knowing”, for a revised damages award of
15 \$61,339,200. (Dkt. No. 338). The Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals unanimously
16 affirmed the judgment in May of 2019. *Krakauer v. Dish Network, L.L.C.*, 925 F.3d
17 643 (4th Cir. 2019). The United States Supreme Court rejected *certiorari* of this
18 matter in December of 2019. *See DISH Network L.L.C. v. Krakauer*, 140 S. Ct. 676
19 (2019).
- 20 xii. Charvat v. Carnival Corporation & PLC, et. al., USDC, ND. Ill., 1:13-cv-00042, a
21 TCPA class settlement of \$12,500,000 granted final approval in April of 2020.
- 22 xiii. Loftus v. Sunrun, Inc., USDC, N.D. Ca., 3:19-cv-1608, a TCPA class settlement of
23 \$5,500,000 granted final approval on May 11, 2021.
- 24 xiv. Andrew Perronq v. Orbit Energy & Power, LLC, USDC, E.D. PA., Civil
25 Action No. No. 2:21-cv-777. A class settlement of **\$6,000,000** granted final
26 approval on June 21, 2022.
- 27 xv. David Vance, et. al. v. DirecTV, LLC, USDC, N.D. WV., Civil Action No. 5:17-
 cv-179. A class settlement of **\$16,850,000** granted final approval on
 August 24, 2023.
- xvi. Berman v. Freedom Financial Network, LLC et al, N.D. CA., Civil Action
 No. 18-cv-1060. A class action settlement of **\$9,750,000** granted final
 approval on February 23, 2024
- xvii. Murray v. Grocery Delivery E-Services USA, Inc. D. MA. Civil Action No.
 19-cv-12608. A class action settlement of **\$11,000,000** granted final
 approval on March 13, 2024.

1 **B. Paronich Law's lodestar and litigation costs**

2 8. Paronich Law has devoted over 750 hours to litigating this matter since August
3 2019, working with no guarantee of being compensated for its time and efforts. Payment of the
4 firm's fees has been contingent on successfully obtaining relief for the plaintiff and class
5 members. As a result, there was a substantial risk of non-payment, particularly in light of the
6 challenges inherent in this type of case. Work on this case has necessarily been to the exclusion
7 of work on other matters that likely would have generated fees. Paronich Law has also been
8 denied use of the fees it earned over the course of this case.

9 9. A document that compiles the contemporaneously maintained billing records for
10 Paronich Law is attached as **Exhibit 1**. I have reviewed these billing records and reduced and
11 eliminated time that was administrative in nature, or that appeared to be redundant or
12 inefficient. It is my firm belief that the time billed was reasonably necessary to litigate this case
13 and secure a settlement on behalf of the plaintiff and the class. I have also estimated 28 hours
14 to travel to and attend the final approval hearing as well as time spent working with the third-
15 party administrator administer the settlement.

16 10. Paronich Law has incurred out-of-pocket litigation expenses totaling \$68,884.67
17 primarily to cover expenses related to expert witnesses, local counsel fees for an enforcement
18 action, forensic costs and service of subpoenas. The following chart summarizes Paronich Law's
19 litigation costs:

Category of Expense	Total
Service of Subpoenas	968.75
Expert Costs	\$33,932
Forensic Analysis Costs	\$19,273.46
Deposition Transcripts	\$7,543.46
Travel (Air Fare, Hotel, Meals)	\$5,827

Category of Expense	Total
Local Counsel for Enforcement Action	\$1,340
TOTAL	\$68,884.67

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of Washington that foregoing is true and correct.

EXECUTED at Hingham, Massachusetts this 19th day of November, 2024.

/s/ Anthony I. Paronich
 Anthony I. Paronich, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27

EXHIBIT 1

Date Range: All time ▾

Bulk Delete Add Time Entry

Total	Billable	Non-Billable	Invoiced	Un-Invoiced
\$573,450.00	\$573,450.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$573,450.00
764.60 hour(s)	764.60 hour(s)	0.00 hour(s)	0.00 hour(s)	764.60 hour(s)

Text Size - +

<input type="checkbox"/>	DATE	ACTIVITY	DURATION	DESCRIPTION	RATE	TOTAL	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Apr 28, 2025	● Correspondence	10.0	Further work associated with claims, distributions and notice with EPIQ	\$750.00/hr	\$7,500.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Apr 25, 2025	● Court Hearing	9.0	Attend final approval and travel back home (ESTIMATED)	\$750.00/hr	\$6,750.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Apr 24, 2025	● Court Hearing	9.0	Travel to and prepare for final approval (ESTIMATED)	\$750.00/hr	\$6,750.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 27, 2025	● Draft Pleadings	6.0	Work on final approval motion and legal research re same (ESTIMATED)	\$750.00/hr	\$4,500.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Dec 27, 2024	● Correspondence	5.0	Communication and Correspondence with EPIQ to facilitate notice and claims issues with settlement (ESTIMATED)	\$750.00/hr	\$3,750.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 13, 2024	● Review	2.1	Review notice revisions from Pillpack and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 7, 2024	● Draft Pleadings	3.4	Work on motion for preliminary approval and legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 1, 2024	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence and phone call with EPIQ re settlement administration	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 29, 2024	● Correspondence	1.1	Correspondence on settlement agreements and	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 17, 2024	● Draft Pleadings	3.2	Review and make edits to Proposed Orders; confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 12, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re settlement	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 3, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re settlement	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 20, 2024	● Draft Pleadings	1.2	Work on settlement agreement and confer re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 19, 2024	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence re settlement and mediation	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 5, 2024	● Mediation	15.5	Conduct Mediation Session and Travel back to Boston	\$750.00/hr	\$11,625.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 4, 2024	● Mediation	9.0	Travel to and Prepare for Mediation	\$750.00/hr	\$6,750.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	May 29, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re mediation; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	DESCRIPTION	PLACEMENT	DESCRIPTION	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> May 24, 2024	● Draft Pleadings	4.2	Work on Pillpack mediation submission and review memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,150.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 8, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re pre-mediation call	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 20, 2024	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with opposing counsel re mediation	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 6, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re potential mediation; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 4, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re potential mediation	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 1, 2024	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence re potential mediation	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 29, 2024	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence re potential mediation and discuss with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$450.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 27, 2024	● Research	1.2	[REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 26, 2024	● Draft Pleadings	3.1	Work on revised Hansen expert report and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 21, 2024	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Work on interrogatory supplement; confer with co-counsel re same; review discovery re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 14, 2024	● Review	0.4	Review latest Pillpack production and edit memo to file re same; correspondence with Magna re deposition	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 12, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with opposing counsel and co-counsel re EPIQ	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 9, 2024	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with opposing counsel and co-counsel re depositions and EPIQ	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 9, 2024	● Review	2.8	Review Pillpack production of documents re consent and edit memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,100.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 6, 2024	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with mark dorf re subpoena and depositions; call with him re same	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 5, 2024	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence re subpoenas and Uribe depositions	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 31, 2024	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Uribe deposition	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 30, 2024	● Review	0.6	Review letter from Pillpack on 3rd party discovery; confer with BC re same	\$750.00/hr \$450.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 25, 2024	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with EPIQ on signed agreement	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 16, 2024	● Review	0.4	Review letter to Pillpack re 3rd party subpoenas; correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 9, 2024	● Correspondence	1.5	Review Order on Motion for Reconsideration and correspondence and call with Pillpack team on next steps	\$750.00/hr \$1,125.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 29, 2023	● Review	2.2	Review Pillpack Production of Documents and Subpoena Responses; edit memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,650.00	Open Anthony Paronich

DATE	DESCRIPTION	PLACEMENT	DESCRIPTION	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 8, 2023	● Phone Call	0.4	Call with Blythe re Pillpack discovery	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 14, 2023	● Correspondence	2.1	Correspondence with EPIQ re opt outs and notice declaration; confer with EPIQ re same and edit the same	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 1, 2023	● Review	0.3	Review case statistics from EPIQ and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 31, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence and call with EPIQ re opt out deadline	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 2, 2023	● Phone Call	0.3	Call with Michelle and e-mail re same on EPIQ notice progress	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 29, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re EPIQ issues and call with Michelle re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 26, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence re EPIQ communications; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 13, 2023	● Research	0.5	Research and review pillpack motion for protective order response	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 12, 2023	● Review	0.3	Review and make edits to IVR script with EPIQ	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 8, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with EPIQ re press release and notice deadlines	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 31, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Blythe re EPIQ notice	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 14, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re formatted notice postcards	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 14, 2023	● Phone Call	0.8	Call with Aaron Woolfson and confer re new Pillpack invoice	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 1, 2023	● Correspondence	3.4	Correspondence re EPIQ communications letter and gather the same	\$750.00/hr \$2,550.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jul 28, 2023	● Correspondence	1.3	Correspondence with counsel re class list and phone call re class list	\$750.00/hr \$975.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jul 21, 2023	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with counsel re class list	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jul 20, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with counsel re class list	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jul 11, 2023	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with EPIQ and phone call with Michelle re stipulated Order	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 29, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence on Pillpack and CRM/Lead Data for Notice list	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 24, 2023	● Research	2.3	Research and correspondence re companies Pillpack sent subpoenas to; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 7, 2023	● Review	1.5	Review latest Pillpack production of documents; edit memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,125.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 18, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Max Morgan re subpoena	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich

DATE	DESCRIPTION	DUPLICATION	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> May 17, 2023	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence and phone call with Max Morgan re local counsel in New Jersey. Confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 4, 2023	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence and legal research regarding Court Order on subpoenas for telephone subscriber info	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 26, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Internal correspondence on telephone carrier subpoenas	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 14, 2023	● Review and Make Edits	0.5	Review and legal research on reply in support of motion to extend notice date	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 13, 2023	● Review	1.2	Review wireless carrier subpoenas and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 12, 2023	● Phone Call	2.4	Call and Correspondence with ██████████ ██████████ confer with co-counsel re same; work with ██████████	\$750.00/hr	\$1,800.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 11, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel re class list issue	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 7, 2023	● Expert Witness Report	3.4	W rk wit ██████████ ██████████ confer with co-counsel re same; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 6, 2023	● Correspondence	0.6	Internal correspondence on stipulation to extend notice date; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 5, 2023	● Review	0.3	Review Stipulation to Extend Notice Deadline	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 3, 2023	● Review Discovery Responses	0.4	Review SDT to Performance Media and 4th Set of Discovery to Pillpack	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 31, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re EPIQ and notice issues	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 28, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Internal correspondence about EPIQ notice plan	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 27, 2023	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with EPIQ re notice plan	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 24, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel re notice plan work	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 22, 2023	● Correspondence	0.1	Correspondence with co-counsel re notice plan	\$750.00/hr	\$75.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 21, 2023	● Correspondence	1.4	Correspondence and phone call with EPIQ re Court's Notice Plan Order	\$750.00/hr	\$1,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 20, 2023	● Review	1.3	Review Notice Plan Order and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 22, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re status conference with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 14, 2023	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with the Court re scheduling conference	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 2, 2023	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence on status report related to notice and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 31, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with EPIQ on class notice	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	DESCRIPTION	PLACEMENT	DESCRIPTION	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 30, 2023	● Correspondence	0.5	Internal correspondence re Pillpack proposal on Case Schedule	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 24, 2023	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with EPIQ re notice and trial issues	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 23, 2023	● Meeting	1.4	Zoom meeting with EPIQ and correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,050.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 20, 2023	● Review	2.1	Review and discuss internally on revised notices from Pillpack; legal research re same and discuss with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 17, 2023	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence internally o [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$450.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 12, 2023	● Draft Pleadings	3.1	Work on Schedule A to Performance media; review discovery and memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 10, 2023	● Review	1.4	Review estimate from EPIQ and join Zoom regarding notice list	\$750.00/hr \$1,050.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 6, 2023	● Review and Make Edits	1.3	Review and make edits t [REDACTED] confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$975.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 4, 2023	● Correspondence	1.1	Correspondence with EPIQ on class notice issues and internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$825.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 4, 2023	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding next steps in case	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 3, 2023	● Correspondence	2.1	Correspondence with EPIQ in terms of class certification order and schedule on the case; confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 23, 2022	● Review	3.1	Review Class Certification Order and Update Memo to File re same; confer with co-counsel in terms of next step	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 5, 2022	● Review	2.1	Review SJ Order from Pillpack and discuss next steps with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 2, 2022	● Draft Pleadings	5.3	Work on reply to class certification motion; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,975.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 26, 2022	● Research	4.1	Research and confer with JRM o [REDACTED] review discovery and deposition testimony re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,075.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 19, 2022	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence on Vestige Reports	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 22, 2022	● Draft Pleadings	4.1	Review and work on renewed class certification motion; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,075.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 21, 2022	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence on confidentiality designations for revised class certification motion; confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 12, 2022	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence about Performance Media and Transfer Records; Call Dorf re same	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 11, 2022	● Review	0.4	Review Hansen subpoena response and confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 8, 2022	● Review	2.1	Review Jennifer Smith Supplemental Expert Report; confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 14, 2022	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Make edits to Pillpack expert report and confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich


DATE	DESCRIPTION	PLACEMENT	DESCRIPTION	DATE	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 14, 2022	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence about Hansen deposition	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 2, 2022	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence internal about [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 24, 2022	● Review	1.1	Review proposed class definition and review discovery documents re same; internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 7, 2022	● Draft Pleadings	1.5	Work on motion for protective order and legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,125.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 4, 2022	● Draft Pleadings	2.4	Work on Hansen expert report; legal research re same; confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,800.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 3, 2022	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence r [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 21, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence o [REDACTED] with client and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 10, 2021	● Review	0.8	Review supplemental analysis from [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 7, 2021	● Correspondence	0.1	Correspondence with co-counsel about [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$75.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 17, 2021	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with opposing counsel [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 16, 2021	● Research	1.1	Research class definition issue and team call	\$750.00/hr \$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 10, 2021	● Review	0.4	Review and make edits to revised schedule from JRM; correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 9, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence related to Pillpack caller ID with Prospects DM and ability to modify expert report	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 5, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with EPIQ re recent Court Order and Next Steps and Internal e-mails re same	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 4, 2021	● Review	3.1	Review Order on Motion to Modify Class Definition; have call with co-counsel re same; review [REDACTED] update memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 2, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence regarding expert deadlines and confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 28, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with EPIQ regarding notice timeline and edit declaration	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 27, 2021	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence with EPIQ about notice and confer with JRM re same; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 26, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	3.2	W rk o [REDACTED]; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 25, 2021	● Phone Call	0.7	Call with Adam on class notice and EPIQ's roll; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 20, 2021	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with Vestige about inspection work and and invoice	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Oct 15, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Internal correspondence on CEG	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION	DEGREE	DESCRIPTION	FEES	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 14, 2021	● Review	1.7	Review 3rd supplemental privilege log from Pillpack and legal research regarding the same	\$750.00/hr \$1,275.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 13, 2021	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with co-counsel on inspection protocol	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 12, 2021	● Review	1.2	Review inspection protocol and legal research re same; confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 8, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	3.3	Work on reply in support of motion to modify; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,475.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 8, 2021	● Correspondence	0.7	Correspondence with Court reporter about rush version of Grant deposition transcript; internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 7, 2021	● Deposition	7.8	Deposition of Josh Grant and communications with co-counsel regarding the same; breakdown of same and finish preparing for the same	\$750.00/hr \$5,850.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 6, 2021	● Review	4.3	Review materials and prepare for Josh Grant deposition	\$750.00/hr \$3,225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 1, 2021	● Review	1.8	Review Jodi breakdown of dialer data and call with JRM re same;	\$750.00/hr \$1,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 30, 2021	● Deposition	4.8	Prepare for and take the Citadel Marketing deposition	\$750.00/hr \$3,600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 27, 2021	● Meet and Confer	2.3	Meet and Confer with Tracy on supplemental Prospects DM Production; confer with co-counsel re same; correspondence with opposing counsel re deposition dates; work with Jodi on Hunt Deposition Exhibits	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 24, 2021	● Deposition	9.4	Prepare for and attend/conduct the LexisNexis Deposition; confer with co-counsel re same; work on Fluent outline re same	\$750.00/hr \$7,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 23, 2021	● Phone Call	1.4	Team call and Prospects meet and confer; correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 22, 2021	● Meet and Confer	3.1	Meet and Confer with Stephen Watkins regarding Yodel supplemental production and campaign IDS; review stipulation on inspection of devices;	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 21, 2021	● Correspondence	1.5	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding deposition and exhibits; review exhibits for the same	\$750.00/hr \$1,125.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 20, 2021	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence related to Tyler Hunt Deposition	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 17, 2021	● Deposition	8.6	Prepare for and take deposition of Nexxa; confer with co-counsel re same; confer with JM re same	\$750.00/hr \$6,450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 16, 2021	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence with and internal correspondence on Citadel Marketing Group	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 15, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	4.1	Review subpoenas for depositions; legal research re same; confer with JM re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 14, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Internal correspondence on deposition subpoenas and Nexxa	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 13, 2021	● Research	3.1	Begin to prepare for Nexxa deposition; talk to Christina and Jen re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 13, 2021	● Phone Call	2.6	Call with co-counsel and expert re Nexxa deposition; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,950.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	COMMIT	DESCRIPTION	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 10, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Internal correspondence on meet and confer	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 8, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	4.2	Work on motion to modify class definition and reply in support of notice plan; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 7, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence about deposition dates; internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 30, 2021	● Correspondence	2.2	Correspondence with Yodel and Prospects; gather more to produce	\$750.00/hr \$1,650.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 27, 2021	● Meet and Confer	0.3	Meet and confer with Stephen on Yodel's subpoena response	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 25, 2021	● Correspondence	0.7	Internal correspondence about Pillpack's meet and confer request	\$750.00/hr \$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 19, 2021	● Meet and Confer	0.9	Meet and Confer with Watkins concerning privilege objection; correspondence re same and communication with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$675.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 12, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Stephen with new deposition date	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 11, 2021	● Correspondence	0.9	Correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel on Yodel deposition	\$750.00/hr \$675.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 10, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Stephen Watkins re subpoena and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 5, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	2.3	Work on Amended Notice Plan and legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 4, 2021	● Review	3.8	Review Supplemental Production by Yodel and Update Memo to File re same; correspondence with co-counsel; send amended deposition subpoena over to Watkins;	\$750.00/hr \$2,850.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 3, 2021	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence with Watkins on recorded message supplement; discuss with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 2, 2021	● Review	1.3	Review supplemental subpoena response and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 29, 2021	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Watkins on deposition	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 27, 2021	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Stephen Watkins re deposition date;	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 26, 2021	● Review	3.5	Review Sharecare subpoena response; correspondence with co-counsel re same; update memo to file re same; confer with Bill Akins re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,625.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 22, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Watkins about Pillpack deposition	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 21, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Watkins on Yodel deposition	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 21, 2021	● Phone Call	1.1	Call with Adam Palmer re reverse lookups and confer with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr \$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 19, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with William Akins re status of subpoena response	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 17, 2021	● Review	3.1	Review supplemental subpoena response from Yodel; update memo to file re same;	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. COST	ACT. COST	STATUS	USER	
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 14, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Stephen on Yodel subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 9, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Draft and send second subpoena to ShareCare out for service; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 8, 2021	● Correspondence	3.4	Meet and confer with Watkins on Yodel subpoena response; confer with co-counsel re same; review supplemental responses to Pillpack discovery requests	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 6, 2021	● Correspondence	0.5	Meet and Confer with Tracy on Prospects DM subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 24, 2021	● Meet and Confer	1.3	Meet nad Confer with Yodel on call record production and limiting the calls to numbers in the spreadsheet; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 23, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Watkins on Yodel subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 14, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with Watkins on Yodel subpoena response and meet and confer	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 13, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	5.1	Continue to review and make edits to response to motion to stay; continue to draft renewed motion to compel Yodel; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 12, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	4.2	Review and make edits to response to motion to stay; draft renewed motion to compel Yodel; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 11, 2021	● Review	1.5	Review Order Denying MTC without Prejudice re Yodel and discuss next steps with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$1,125.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 10, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	1.8	Draft Declaration for LBM: confer on the same with Jonathan Kornvein for LBM	\$750.00/hr	\$1,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 9, 2021	● Correspondence	0.9	Correspondence with Prospects DM re subpoena response; Same with LBM re subpoena issues	\$750.00/hr	\$675.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 8, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	3.4	Work on motion for leave to file a reply on Yodel enforcement action; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 7, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Yodel re enforcement action	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 4, 2021	● Phone Call	0.8	Confer with LBM; and Stephen Watkins re subpoenas and enforcement action;	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 2, 2021	● Review	4.3	Review response to Yodel motion to compel; outline reply re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 1, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Prospects DM re subpoena; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	May 26, 2021	● Correspondence	3.4	Gather Correspondence with Yodel, Prospects and LBM; send the same to co-counsel; internal e-mails re JSR; review Active Prospects Subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	May 25, 2021	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with Watkins re Yodel response and Prospects DM correspondence; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	May 20, 2021	● Correspondence	0.6	Draft Correspondence to Tracy re Prospects DM subpoena; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	May 18, 2021	● Correspondence	0.7	Yodel Correspondence to yodel counsel with call records; internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr	\$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. FEE	ACT. FEE	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> May 17, 2021	● Correspondence	2.2	Correspondence with Tracy re ProspectsDM subpoena response and affidavit; internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,650.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 14, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence about ProspectsDM response and Yodel reference	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 12, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with co-counsel about Yodel production and confer with Blythe and Jen re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 10, 2021	● Phone Call	0.5	Call with co-counsel about Yodel supplement; correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 5, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence from Yodel regarding Pillpack; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 3, 2021	● Review	1.4	Review subpoena response from Prospects DM and confer with Tracy Francis; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 28, 2021	● Review	3.4	Review supplement from yodel on consent from Eric Allen and update memo to file re same; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 27, 2021	● Review	4.2	Review supplement by Yodel; draft revised motion to compel for Yodel; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 26, 2021	● Review	1.1	Review supplemental privilege log by PP regarding Yodel; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 19, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	5.4	Draft motion to compel Yodel in Florida; meet and confer re same; confer with co-counsel re same; draft and serve Active Prospect subpoena; meet and confer re same with Active Prospect; begin to make edits to JSR re Notice	\$750.00/hr	\$4,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 17, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence about Yodel with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 16, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	3.2	Work on subpoena to Prospects; Meet and confer re Yodel; prepare for and participate in joint call re notice	\$750.00/hr	\$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 9, 2021	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Eric Allen re Yodel	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 9, 2021	● Review	3.1	Review supplemental response from LBM regarding leads and insertion order; update memo to file re same; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 7, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel on yodel, fluent and Littlebrook	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 6, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Call and correspondence with LBM regarding subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 5, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with LBM re subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 2, 2021	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence with Jonathan Kornvein regarding LBM subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 2, 2021	● Correspondence	1.3	Correspondence with Little Brook Media and their former counsel regarding subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 1, 2021	● Correspondence	1.8	Gather e-mails with Eric Allen re Pillpack and Yodel; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. RATE	EST. AMOUNT	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 29, 2021	● Correspondence	1.4	Correspondence with co-counsel about response to motion to approve notice plan; call with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 26, 2021	● Review	3.5	Review Purported Consent File from Pillpack; update memo to file re same; correspondence with co-counsel re Banner Ads and notice.	\$750.00/hr	\$2,625.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 25, 2021	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Eric Allen regarding the purported consent that Prospects DM has	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 18, 2021	● Research	3.1	Research and review [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 17, 2021	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence and Phone Call with Eric Allen regarding Yodel production supplement	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 11, 2021	● Phone Call	0.4	Call with JRM re EPIQ and status; follow up with Eric Allen re Yodel preservation	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 10, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	2.3	Revise Cam Declaration and draft press release for notice	\$750.00/hr	\$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 9, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	4.2	Work on motion to approve notice plan and legal research re same; review services agreement from EPIQ	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 8, 2021	● Correspondence	1.3	Correspondence with EPIQ on finalizing the bid and work on a declaration for Cam re same	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 8, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Eric Allen regarding Yodel subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 3, 2021	● Review	0.8	Review revised EPIQ bid and correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 2, 2021	● Review	1.6	Review order on motion for reconsideration and correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,200.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 1, 2021	● Correspondence	1.4	Correspondence on bids and administration; call with Adam and Rob re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 27, 2021	● Draft Pleadings	3.5	Work on class notice documents; legal research re same and edits to same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,625.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 26, 2021	● Review	1.2	review and compare bids from EPIQ and KCC	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 26, 2021	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with EPIQ re bid for class notice	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 26, 2021	● Phone Call	1.3	Call with Eric Allen regarding Yodel and Preservation; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 19, 2021	● Correspondence	3.4	Correspondence with core assumptions to KCC and EPIQ for bid; call with same on class notice	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 18, 2021	● Review	1.7	Review PN Estimate for notice and create outline for getting other bids	\$750.00/hr	\$1,275.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 17, 2021	● Review	2.3	[REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Feb 16, 2021	● Review	0.4	Review SJ Order and News story on Decision 	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	COMMIT	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. HRS	EST. AMT	STATUS	USER
Feb 13, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Draft Pleadings	3.2	Work on Preservation Letter to Yodel; review and make edits o [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Feb 13, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Review	2.3	review and discuss order on motion to certify class; correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Feb 12, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence regarding CEG regarding invoices and same with JRM	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Feb 4, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Draft Pleadings	3.8	Work on supplemental memo for class cert re [REDACTED]; legal researc [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$2,850.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Feb 1, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Review	3.4	review [REDACTED] correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Feb 1, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Draft Pleadings	0.4	Work on JSR redlines; confer with BET re same	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 29, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence and call with JRM about trial timeline	\$750.00/hr \$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 28, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel re meet and confer and trial prep	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 25, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence regarding trial prep and timeline; confer with JRM re same and Joint Status Report	\$750.00/hr \$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 21, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding organizational call	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 21, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Research	2.6	Work on legal research in connection with supplement; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,950.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 16, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Research	2.3	Continue to work on memo to file on consent for brief	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 15, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Research	3.2	Work on memo to file on consent for brief	\$750.00/hr \$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Jan 5, 2021	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Review Discovery Responses	3.1	Review PillPack Slack Discovery Supplement; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Dec 22, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Research	3.4	Research and correspondence with co-counsel regarding supplemental submission; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Dec 21, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Draft Pleadings	2.6	Work on motion to supplement; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,950.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Dec 18, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel about the [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Dec 15, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence re recordings and review of the same	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Nov 12, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.4	Meet and Confer and Correspondence with Fluent re Production	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Nov 6, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	2.3	Correspondence with Flunet about subpoena and analyze [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Oct 29, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Fluent re deposition	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
Oct 19, 2020	<input type="checkbox"/>	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Fluent re subpoena	\$750.00/hr \$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	PROJECT	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. HRS	EST. FEE	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 15, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4 Correspondence with Fluent re deposition subpoena and correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 9, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4 Correspondence re Fluent leads with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 1, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3 Correspondence with Fluent's counsel re subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 30, 2020	● Correspondence	0.5 Correspondence to Fluent regarding subpoena and phone call with counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 22, 2020	● Review	1.3 Review and research regarding Pillpack's Supplemental Privilege Log	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 21, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	3.1 Work on opposition to motion for summary judgment; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 15, 2020	● Research	1.1 Research and e-mails with JRM regarding [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 14, 2020	● Phone Call	0.5 Phone call with Hayes over calendar invite; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 4, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	5.3 Work on class cert reply; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 2, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	5.1 Work on class cert reply; legal research re same; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 2, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	4.2 Work on class cert reply; legal research re same; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 1, 2020	● Review	3.4 Review PP 15th Document production and work on memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 25, 2020	● Phone Call	0.3 Call Tom Hayes on calendar issue and correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 22, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	3.1 Review response to Motion to Class Certification; work on outlining the reply to the same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 20, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	2.3 Draft Deposition notice for Prospects DM; correspondence with opposing counsel and co-counsel regarding the same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 11, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	1.2 Review and work on reply to motion to seal documents related to class certification	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 7, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	2.1 Draft and review opposition to motion to stay; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Aug 4, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	1.8 Conference with sharecare's counsel; review dec; file SoD of Georgia action	\$750.00/hr	\$1,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 27, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2 Correspondence with William Akins re Sharecare Declaration	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 24, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	4.1 Work on motion for class certification; confer with co-counsel re same; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 23, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	4.2 Work on Class Certification motion; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 18, 2020	● Research	3.1 Research regardin [REDACTED] communication with JRM re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION	EST. COST	ACT. COST	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 17, 2020	● Deposition	4.5	Attend Christy Robinson deposition; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 15, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Communication with co-counsel re case deadlines	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 14, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel re Tom Hayes call and communications with co-counsel re Sharecare	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 13, 2020	● Phone Call	0.4	Phone Call with Tom Hayes re Anderson and communication with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 10, 2020	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence with Sharecare regarding enforcement action and communication with Mark Dorf regarding subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 8, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Mark Dorf regarding affidavit	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 8, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence about second Prospects DM subpoena;	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 7, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	1.7	W r k o [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$1,275.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 6, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel about Sharecare production and list of numbers;	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jul 1, 2020	● Meet and Confer	1.2	MEet and confer with propsects dm; correspondence with co-counsel re discovery disputes	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 30, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	0.2	Finalize and send over amended deposition notice for Anderson	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 29, 2020	● Phone Call	1.2	Call with co-counsel and counsel for Anderson; memo re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 26, 2020	● Correspondence	0.1	Correspondence with co-counsel re Christie Anderson subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$75.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 23, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Hayes re deposition and Neil re Little Brook Media	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 22, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Tom Hayes re Christie Anderson subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 16, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel re Prospects DM dialing records	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 15, 2020	● Phone Call	0.5	Call and Correspondence about Byte Success Deposition; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 12, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Neil Ansen re Little Brook Media	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 9, 2020	● Phone Call	2.1	Confer with third party re subpoena responses; work on sharecare enforcement action and confer with co-counsel re expert reply reports	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 8, 2020	● Correspondence	2.2	Correspondence about 3rd party communications and gather same; send to Jodi	\$750.00/hr	\$1,650.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 8, 2020	● Review Discovery Responses	3.1	Review and gather e-mails for production	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jun 4, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Finalize and Send Steve Koval Sharecare Motion to Enforce	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. HRS	EST. FEE	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 4, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with JRM re outstanding items	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 3, 2020	● Meet and Confer	1.1	Meet and Confer with Eric Allen regarding communications with counsel; meet and confer with William Akins re enforcement actions and correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 3, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	3.1	Draft sharecare enforcement action; work with co-counsel to get it filed; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 2, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel re next steps in the case;	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jun 1, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	3.1	Review Pillpack Expert Reports and confer with JM re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 31, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with JRM re Swindle Deposition	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 28, 2020	● Deposition	3.1	Work on deposition outline; confer with co-counsel re same and litigation strategy	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 26, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel re organizational call and 30(b)96) deposition outline	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 26, 2020	● Correspondence	0.7	Correspondence and conference with William Akins re meet and confer and enforcement action for Sharecare	\$750.00/hr	\$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 25, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	4.2	Draft enforcement action; confer with co-counsel re same; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 20, 2020	● Deposition	9.1	Prepare for and defend Anya deposition; confer with co-counsel re same and draft summary of same	\$750.00/hr	\$6,825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 19, 2020	● Correspondence	0.8	Internal correspondence about [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 18, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with opposing counsel re Anya deposition	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 17, 2020	● Deposition	4.1	Prepare expert for deposition; call with experts re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 16, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Anya regarding deposition	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 15, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence regarding Anya supplemental report	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 14, 2020	● Meet and Confer	3.2	Prepare for and attend meet and confer; review and pull documents with subpoena recipients	\$750.00/hr	\$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 13, 2020	● Expert Witness Report	3.1	Work on [REDACTED] confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 12, 2020	● Expert Witness Report	4.1	Work with expert on supplemental report; pull e-mails for defensive discovery responses; confer with co-counsel re same and next steps	\$750.00/hr	\$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 11, 2020	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence with Anya and Christina and co-counsel re expert report	\$750.00/hr	\$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 8, 2020	● Expert Witness Report	2.1	Work with expert on report; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> May 7, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Anya about next steps and production	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> May 4, 2020	● Correspondence	1.3	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED] for [REDACTED]; research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> May 4, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel about [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 29, 2020	● Phone Call	0.5	Call with JRM [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 27, 2020	● Review	2.3	Review Remote Deposition Stipulation and confer with co-counsel re same; research re similar agreements in light of COVID	\$750.00/hr	\$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 22, 2020	● Correspondence	1.3	Review correspondence regarding plaintiff discovery responses and expert subpoenas; correspondence with Bill Akins re Sharecare	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 17, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence review and edits re remote depositions	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 15, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel about [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 14, 2020	● Meet and Confer	0.8	Meet and confer with SHarecare; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 13, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Sharecare about meet and confer	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 7, 2020	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with CEG about invoice and DNC payment	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 6, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence about CEG expert report and payment	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 3, 2020	● Correspondence	1.3	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding [REDACTED] and review letter from Pillpack regarding Plaintiff discovery responses	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 2, 2020	● Meet and Confer	0.8	Review information and conduct meet and confer with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Apr 1, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 31, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Work on revisions to expert report; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 30, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with William Akins on Sharecare subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 26, 2020	● Correspondence	1.1	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 25, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Work on Expert Report; Meet and Confer and Sharecare	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 24, 2020	● Meet and Confer	0.5	Meet and Confer with William Akins re Sharecare production and next steps	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 23, 2020	● Review	0.7	Review information and follow up with ShareCare	\$750.00/hr	\$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 20, 2020	● Review and Make Edits	2.2	Review initial report of Jeffrey Hansen; suggest edits re same and talk to jeff re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,650.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	
<input type="checkbox"/> Mar 19, 2020	● Phone Call	0.7	Phone Call with Eric Allen re ProspectDM production and correspondence regarding redacted spreadsheets with opposing counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$525.00	Open	Anthony Paronich	

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. HRS	EST. FEE	STATUS	USER	
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 16, 2020	● Correspondence	0.9	Correspondence regarding Prospects Affidavit and Yodel production; confer with Eric Allen re same	\$750.00/hr	\$675.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 16, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence about [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 12, 2020	● Meet and Confer	2.1	Meet and confer re ProspectsDM and Yodel response; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 12, 2020	● Review Discovery Responses	2.4	Review supplemental subpoena response; confer with co-counsel re same [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$1,800.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 10, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Sharecare's counsel about meet and confer	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 10, 2020	● Phone Call	2.8	Confer with Eric Allen re recording and correspondence with co-counsel about the Pillpack stipulation; correspondence with Yodel about the Pillpack "opt in" data and further review of Yodel affidavit re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,100.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 9, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Sharecare's counsel regarding meet and confer request	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 8, 2020	● Meet and Confer	0.8	Review responses and conduct meet and confer with Yodel; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 8, 2020	● Review Discovery Responses	1.2	Review responses and prep for meet and confer call tomorrow re Yodel	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 6, 2020	● Review Discovery Responses	1.2	Review Sharecare discovery responses; confer with co-counsel re same; draft meet and confer to Sharecare	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Mar 3, 2020	● Phone Call	4.5	Phone Call with Eric Allen regarding affidavit; review letter from Pillpack regarding depositions and Coronavirus; begin to review PP 9th production and confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 28, 2020	● Review	4.3	Review Yodel subpoena response; and begin to review PP 8th Production; edit memo to file re same;	\$750.00/hr	\$3,225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 27, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	2.4	Work on affidavit draft; confer with co-counsel re same; confer with opposing counsel for Prospects DM	\$750.00/hr	\$1,800.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 25, 2020	● Correspondence	0.5	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the production; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 24, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence about Jeff Hansen report; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 21, 2020	● Review and Make Edits	0.4	Review affidavit draft from Prospect DM; confer with Eric Allen re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 20, 2020	● Correspondence	3.2	Correspondence with Eric Allen about Prospects Disposition Codes and dialer vendors; Vici Admin Manual and Hansen expert output; review data re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,400.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 19, 2020	● Correspondence	1.5	Correspondence with Sharecare regarding extension request and correspondence with Eric Allen regarding disposition codes; research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,125.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 18, 2020	● Review	0.4	Review Jeff Hansen engagement letter and discuss same with JRM	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION	DESCRIPTION	DATE	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 13, 2020	● Review	2.1	Review affidavit and subpoena response for Prospects DM with Eric Allen	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 12, 2020	● Correspondence	1.4	Correspondence with Neil Asnen re little brook subpoena and review of draft affidavit; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,050.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 12, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence re deposition notices	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 11, 2020	● Phone Call	1.2	Phone call with Eric Allen and Tom Hayes to finalize Byte Success affidavit; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 8, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Neil Asnen regarding Little Brook media subpoena	\$750.00/hr \$150.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 7, 2020	● Phone Call	3.1	Phone Call with Eric Allen regarding data; [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 6, 2020	● Research	2.1	Discussion regarding [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$1,575.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 5, 2020	● Correspondence	4.5	Correspondence with co-counsel re depositions and begin to review Pillpack's 6th production of Documents; confer with co-counsel re same; discussion o [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr \$3,375.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 4, 2020	● Review Discovery Responses	2.2	Review discovery and respond to e-mails from co-counsel regarding next steps in the litigation	\$750.00/hr \$1,650.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Feb 3, 2020	● Correspondence	1.1	Correspondence re Sharecare subpoena and Yodel subpoena;	\$750.00/hr \$825.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 31, 2020	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with Little Brook Media regarding Plaintiff phone number; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$600.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 28, 2020	● Correspondence	4.1	Correspondence and conference with Eric Allen re ShareCare as source of data for Pillpack calling by Prospects DM; confer with co-counsel re same and correspondence with co-counsel re same; review Sharecare invoice [REDACTED] correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$3,075.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 27, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	1.9	W rk on [REDACTED] confer with co-counsel re same; review case documents re same	\$750.00/hr \$1,425.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 23, 2020	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence with Hayes regarding Byte success and affidavit; internal correspondence re same	\$750.00/hr \$450.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 22, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Mr. Dorf and Hayes regarding subpoenas and declarations	\$750.00/hr \$300.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 20, 2020	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence with Thomas Hayes and Mark Dorf re declarations and Byte Success; correspondence internally regarding the same	\$750.00/hr \$900.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 20, 2020	● Review Discovery Responses	2.3	Review documents and e-mails; work o [REDACTED] discuss the same and deposition scheduling with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr \$1,725.00	Open Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Jan 19, 2020	● Research	3.1	Research on other TCPA.Pillpack cases filed; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr \$2,325.00	Open Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. COST	ACT. COST	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 17, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re status of Pillpack production;	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 16, 2020	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding discovery call	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 14, 2020	● Meet and Confer	2.1	Meet and confer with subpoena recipient; confer with co-counsel re same and strategy for litigation moving forward	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 13, 2020	● Draft Pleadings	3.1	Review subpoena response from Prospect; draft subpoena to Little Brook; work on [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 9, 2020	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence with Eric Allen regarding IO production and review IO; update memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 7, 2020	● Correspondence	0.2	Correspondence with Mark Dorf regarding his declaration	\$750.00/hr	\$150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 6, 2020	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with Walter re Byte Success e-mails; correspondence with Mr. Dorf regarding Eric Allen	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Jan 3, 2020	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with Mark Dorf re Declaration; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 16, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	3.1	Review Byte Success Production and work on [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 15, 2019	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with Tom Hayes regarding Byte Success e-mails; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 10, 2019	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with co-counsel and confer re [REDACTED] of Mark Dorf Affidavit	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 5, 2019	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence with co-counsel re Pillpack DNC list and [REDACTED] of Mark Dorf Declaration	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 4, 2019	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel re 3rd party discovery	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Dec 3, 2019	● Correspondence	1.2	Correspondence with Eric Allen regarding Yodel supplement and LandFall Data	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 26, 2019	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with co-counsel re Dorf Affidavit	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 20, 2019	● Phone Call	0.5	Call with counsel for Byte Success re subpoena response; update to co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 15, 2019	● Draft Pleadings	2.1	Work on Mark Dorf affidavit; confer with Eric Allen re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 14, 2019	● Document Preparation	1.2	Prepare affidavit for Dorf; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 14, 2019	● Meet and Confer	2.3	Confer with Landfall re subpoena; confer with co-counsel re same; work on affidavit re Dorf	\$750.00/hr	\$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 13, 2019	● Correspondence	0.6	Correspondence with Jason Fine re Landfall subpoena response and data	\$750.00/hr	\$450.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Nov 11, 2019	● Meet and Confer	1.1	Confer with Byte counsel re scope of subpoena; talk with co-counsel re same and work on affidavit outline	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	EVENT	DURATION	DESCRIPTION	EST. RATE	EST. COST	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 10, 2019	● Correspondence	1.1 E-mails and call with Eric Allen regarding Prospects DM production; correspondence with Tom Hayes about Byte Success Marketing subpoena;	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 6, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	1.1 Review subpoena response from Landfall; call Eric Allen re same; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 5, 2019	● Correspondence	0.5 Correspondence with co-counsel regarding deposition notices and timing	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 4, 2019	● Phone Call	1.1 Call with Chris Wager and Jason Fine re Landfall; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 3, 2019	● Review	4.8 Finish review document production; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 2, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	4.2 Continue to review document production; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Nov 1, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	4.5 Begin to review document production; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 31, 2019	● Review	1.2 Review latest notes of Pillpack discovery review and supplement same; review production from Cricket wireless	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 29, 2019	● Correspondence	0.8 Correspondence and meet and confer with Eric Allen regarding calling record and date ranges; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 28, 2019	● Correspondence	0.1 Correspondence with co-counsel regarding Byte Success	\$750.00/hr	\$75.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 25, 2019	● Meet and Confer	3.1 Continue meet and confer with ProspectDM; draft and serve Landfall subpoena related to consent	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 24, 2019	● Meet and Confer	1.2 Meet and Confer with Prospects; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 21, 2019	● Correspondence	0.4 Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding missing spreadsheet from production	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 19, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	6.2 Review supplemental production from Pillpack, correspondence to cocounsel regarding the same, edit memo to file.	\$750.00/hr	\$4,650.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 11, 2019	● Review	2.1 Review settlement offer and discuss with co-counsel; review and supplement JRM summary of Calling Records and Performance Media Production	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 10, 2019	● Meet and Confer	1.2 Pillpack meet and confer; talk strategy with Jen; reach out to Eric Allen re same	\$750.00/hr	\$900.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 9, 2019	● Correspondence	0.4 Correspondence with co-counsel regarding deposition notices and conference	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 8, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	2.1 Review ProspectDM production and update memo to file; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,575.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 7, 2019	● Review	4.1 Review subpoena response from ProspectDM; confer with co-counsel re same; work on memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 5, 2019	● Correspondence	0.3 Correspondence with Eric Allen's office regarding subpoena response	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION	EST. RATE	EST. AMOUNT	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 4, 2019	● Correspondence	3.4	Conference with Eric Allen regarding 4,000,000 call records and transfer call records; research re dialing system and CRM used; correspondence with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 3, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	4.1	Review latest discovery production; update memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 2, 2019	● Meet and Confer	1.6	Confer with ProspectDM re calling records; confer with co-counsel re strategy	\$750.00/hr	\$1,200.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Oct 1, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	1.8	Review call logs; confer with co-counsel re same; meet and confer with Prospects re production	\$750.00/hr	\$1,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 30, 2019	● Correspondence	0.8	Correspondence with co-counsel re discovery conference and correspondence with opposing counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 28, 2019	● Draft Pleadings	5.8	Work on Subpoena to BBB; continue review of ProspectsDM supplement; confer with co-counsel re same; work on 30b6 and 30b1 notices	\$750.00/hr	\$4,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 27, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	3.1	Review Discovery Responses; update memo to file; confer with co-counsel re same; confer with counsel for ProspectDM re subpoena supplement	\$750.00/hr	\$2,325.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 26, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	4.1	Review Production and Work on Memo to File	\$750.00/hr	\$3,075.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 25, 2019	● Correspondence	0.3	Correspondence with co-counsel about Pillpack check in call	\$750.00/hr	\$225.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 24, 2019	● Correspondence	1.1	Correspondence with Co-counsel about Tyler Hunt meet and confer and subpoena to Cricket Wireless	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 23, 2019	● Review	2.2	Review stipulation to extend deadlines and correspondence with co-counsel re same; correspondence with Tyler Hunt re subpoena	\$750.00/hr	\$1,650.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 20, 2019	● Review	3.5	Continued Review of Pillpack document production and update memo to file re same; correspondence with co-counsel re memo to file	\$750.00/hr	\$2,625.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 19, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	4.2	Begin to review document production; work on memo to file re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 18, 2019	● Review	3.8	Review subpoena to Cricket Wireless; Meet and Confer with Mark Dorf re subpoena response; review meet and confer e-mails from Walter; Meet and Confer with Eric Allen regarding naming Prospects DM and production of call logs	\$750.00/hr	\$2,850.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 14, 2019	● Correspondence	0.9	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding ESI search terms and response	\$750.00/hr	\$675.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 14, 2019	● Review	3.4	Review discovery dispute e-mail and search term list; confer with co-counsel re same; work on outline of production parameters for Eric Allen	\$750.00/hr	\$2,550.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 13, 2019	● Phone Call	1.1	Phone Calls and E-mails with Eric Allen regarding Prospects DM Subpoena Response; confer with co-counsel re same	\$750.00/hr	\$825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/>	Sep 12, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	4.2	Review Performance Supplement; Memo to File re Same; Correspondence to File	\$750.00/hr	\$3,150.00	Open	Anthony Paronich

DATE	ACTIVITY	FUNCTION	DESCRIPTION	EST. HRS	EST. FEE	STATUS	USER
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 11, 2019	● Correspondence	2.4	Meet and Confer with Mark Dorf regarding his subpoena response; begin to review Performance Media response and work on memo re same	\$750.00/hr	\$1,800.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 10, 2019	● Draft Pleadings	1.8	Finalize and send Byte Marketing subpoena out for service	\$750.00/hr	\$1,350.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 9, 2019	● Draft Pleadings	3.8	draft and serve Hunt and Byte subpoena: work on ESI Search terms re same and correspondence with co-counsel re same.	\$750.00/hr	\$2,850.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 7, 2019	● Review Discovery Responses	5.1	Review pleadings in the case; discovery responses; memo to file re same; draft Schedule A for Hunt Subpoena and Meet and Confer Letter to Each Subpoena Recipient	\$750.00/hr	\$3,825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 6, 2019	● Correspondence	5.1	Correspondence re PHV; Defendant's initial disclosures and status of 3rd party subpoenas; review discovery responses from Pillpack and work on memo to file; review case file re same; legal research re same	\$750.00/hr	\$3,825.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 6, 2019	● Draft Pleadings	0.5	Work on PHV motion	\$750.00/hr	\$375.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 5, 2019	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence with JPA	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 4, 2019	● Draft Pleadings	1.3	Review JPA and make edits	\$750.00/hr	\$975.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Sep 3, 2019	● Correspondence	0.4	Correspondence re JPA with co-counsel	\$750.00/hr	\$300.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 29, 2019	● Phone Call	0.8	E-mails and Phone Call for introduction to team and Walter; confer with JM re same	\$750.00/hr	\$600.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 17, 2019	● Correspondence	2.3	review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	\$750.00/hr	\$1,725.00	Open	Anthony Paronich
<input type="checkbox"/> Aug 9, 2019	● Phone Call	1.4	Confer with Jen Murray about joining the case; discuss Prospects DM; research current DM Prospect involvement in federal court	\$750.00/hr	\$1,050.00	Open	Anthony Paronich